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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

 
BARBARA SMITH OF COMMERCIAL METALS COMPANY NAMED 2019 AIST 

STEELMAKER OF THE YEAR 
 

PITTSBURGH, 9 April 2019 — Barbara R. Smith, president and chief executive officer, Commercial Metals 
Company, will be named AIST Steelmaker of the Year at AISTech 2019 — The Iron & Steel Technology 
Conference and Exposition. One of AIST’s highest honors, the Steelmaker of the Year Award is given to an 
industry leader who has had significant impact on the industry and on his or her business. 
 
During her eight years at Commercial Metals Company (CMC), Smith has fostered a culture of safety, 
community and customer service, and continual improvement, thereby enhancing the company’s position as a 
leader in the recycling and construction steel markets.   
  
Most recently, she guided CMC through a transformative acquisition that has greatly expanded its capacity and 
geographic reach. She also has overseen the launch and ongoing ramp up of the company’s new long products 
mill in Oklahoma. The facility is the second such mill in its fleet to utilize a highly efficient continuous production 
process, and it has allowed the company to reach new customers and supply cost-effective steel solutions, 
including spooled rebar.   
  
Smith has served as president and chief executive officer since 1 September 2017 and was named board 
chairman in January 2018. She first joined CMC in June 2011 as senior vice president and chief financial officer 
and was then promoted to the position of chief operating officer in January 2016. 
 
Prior to joining CMC, Smith served for five years as vice president and chief financial officer for Gerdau 
Ameristeel in Tampa, Fla. She also served as senior vice president and chief financial officer for FARO 
Technologies Inc. in Orlando, Fla. Her career includes more than 20 years’ service with Alcoa Inc., where she 
held a variety of leadership positions across various businesses within Alcoa. Smith served on the board of 
directors at Minerals Technologies Inc. from May 2011 through July 2017. She has been actively involved in 
various community organizations and currently serves on the Dallas board of the American Heart Association. 
She is a graduate of Purdue University with a degree in accounting, and is also a Certified Public Accountant. 
 
The award will be presented on 7 May 2019 during the President’s Award Breakfast, one of the signature 
events of AISTech. The breakfast program will consist of the presentation of several Board of Directors awards, 
followed by a keynote address titled “Steelmaking for the Next Generation,” by David B. Burritt, president and 
chief executive officer, United States Steel Corporation.  
 
AISTech is the world’s largest annual gathering of steel industry personnel. AISTech 2019 will be held 6–9 May 
2019 at the David L. Lawrence Convention Center in Pittsburgh, Pa., USA, and will offer a program with 
hundreds of technical presentations, an expansive exposition, plant tours, a unique Town Fall Forum and 
keynote presentations by today’s business leaders. 
 
To attend the President’s Award Breakfast or other events, please complete the online press registration form. 
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The Association for Iron & Steel Technology (AIST) is an international technical association of more than 17,500 
professional and student members, representing iron and steel producers, their allied suppliers and related 
academia. The association is dedicated to advancing the technical development, production, processing and 
application of iron and steel. 

# # # 
Editor’s Note:  
For individual photos or more information, please contact Stacy Varmecky, general manager — sales & 
marketing, AIST, phone: +1.724.814.3066.  
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